

**EXHIBIT B2-C**  
**(DORSEY'S INVOICES – ASSET DISPOSITION)**



SALT LAKE CITY OFFICE  
801-933-7360

(Tax Identification No. 41-0223337)

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
10 Exchange Place, #502  
Salt Lake City, UT 84111

May 22, 2015  
Invoice No. \*\*\*\*\*

Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
Asset Disposition

---

For Legal Services Rendered Through December 31, 2014

**INVOICE TOTAL**

Total For Current Legal Fees	\$52,950.50
<b>Total For Current Invoice</b>	<b>\$52,950.50</b>

For your convenience, please remit payment to the address below or we offer the option of remitting payment electronically by wire transfer. If you have any questions regarding this information, please contact the lawyer you are working with on this project or Dorsey's Accounts Receivable Department at 1-800-861-0760. Thank you.

Mailing Instructions:  
Dorsey & Whitney LLP  
P.O. Box 1680  
Minneapolis, MN 55480-1680

Wire Instructions:  
U.S. Bank National Association  
800 Nicollet Mall  
Minneapolis, MN 55402

ABA Routing Number: 091000022  
Account Number: 1602-3010-8500  
Swift Code: USBKUS44IMT

**Please make reference to the invoice number**

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

**ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY**

SALT LAKE CITY OFFICE  
801-933-7360

(Tax Identification No. 41-0223337)

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
10 Exchange Place, #502  
Salt Lake City, UT 84111

May 22, 2015  
Invoice No. \*\*\*\*\*

Client-Matter No: 492728-00003

Asset Disposition

For Legal Services Rendered Through December 31, 2014

02/10/14	C. Martinez	0.90	252.00	Review closing documents for Receiver's transfer of the River Run property to Barclay pursuant to the terms of the Court-approved Settlement Agreement (.9)
02/11/14	M. Durrant	2.30	782.00	Review closing documents for the National Note/Riverbend transaction (1.0); prepare revisions to documents (1.2); prepare correspondence to C. Martinez (.1)
02/11/14	C. Martinez	0.70	196.00	Review closing documents and attend closing of agreement between Receiver and Barclay Associates (.7)
02/16/14	C. Martinez	0.30	84.00	Revise motion to approve settlement with American West Bank and correspond with P. Hunt re same (.3)
02/17/14	C. Martinez	0.20	56.00	Revise motion to approve settlement with Far West Bank (.2)
02/18/14	C. Martinez	0.20	56.00	(Barclay) Correspond with opposing counsel concerning final document needed

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 2

				for closing (.2)
03/12/14	J. Armington	2.50	650.00	Draft motion to sell Elkhorn lot 3 (2.5)
03/17/14	J. Armington	3.90	1,014.00	Draft motion to sell autumn ridge lot 3, declaration in support of same, and proposed order granting same, gather all exhibits and send to P Hunt for review (3.9)
03/25/14	M. Hunt	0.20	74.00	Review email from W. Klein regarding Expressway property, respond to same, and conference with M. Durrant regarding same (.2)
03/25/14	M. Hunt	3.00	1,110.00	Review correspondence re Autumn Ridge Lot 3 sale and instructions to staff on obtaining documents on same (.2) ; review and revise motion and declaration re sale of Autumn Ridge Lot 3 (2.4) ; review and revise proposed publication notice motion on Autumn Ridge Lot 3 sale and email to W. Klein re same (.3); email to J. Armington re tasks on same (.1)
03/26/14	C. Martinez	0.40	112.00	Review status of ABIs and correspond with W. Klein and J. Armington regarding additional information to include/exclude from motion for approval to sale Autumn Ridge properties (.4)
03/26/14	J. Armington	3.70	962.00	Draft, revise and file motion, declaration, and notice motion for autumn ridge lot 3 sale (3.7)
03/26/14	M. Hunt	1.00	370.00	Review email from W. Klein and comments on Autumn Ridge Lot 3 sale motions and related papers, correspondence with W. Klein regarding same, and email to J. Armington regarding tasks necessary prior to filing (.4); review and final changes to publication method notice on Autumn Ridge Lot 3 sale and correspondence with J. Armington (.1); review all documents for filing, instructions to J. Armington on

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 3

				exhibits, and authorize filing of all documents (.3); email to W. Klein regarding filing of same and review issues on Elkhorn appraiser approval and email to J. Armington regarding filing motion on same (.2)
03/26/14	M. DiFrancesco	0.60	108.00	File receiver's motion to sell Autumn Ridge Lot 3 and related exhibits (.2); file declaration of Wayne Klein in support of same and related exhibits (.2); file motion and memorandum in support of form of publication notice of sale of real property and related exhibits (.2)
03/28/14	J. Armington	1.50	390.00	Draft, revise, and file motion to appoint elkhorn appraiser (1.5)
03/28/14	M. Hunt	0.50	185.00	Review and revise motion and order regarding appraiser on Elkhorn Lots and email to W. Klein regarding same (.4); further correspondence with W. correspondence and J. Armington regarding same (.1)
03/31/14	M. Hunt	0.20	74.00	Correspondence with J. Armington and W. Klein regarding sale motion issues (.2)
04/01/14	C. Martinez	0.10	28.00	Review correspondence from APS concerning accounts holding ABIs (.1)
04/01/14	M. Hunt	0.10	37.00	Read letter from APS regarding Autumn Ridge Lot 3 sale motion, and correspondence with J. Armington and E. Stauffer regarding service (.1)
04/01/14	E. Stauffer	0.30	55.50	Receive and review letter from APS re motion to sell autumn ridge lot 3, forward copies to Packer, Mathison, Wilson, Crossman and Wilson (.3)
04/02/14	J. Armington	0.90	234.00	Draft Riverbend appraiser motion (.9)
04/02/14	M. Hunt	0.10	37.00	Correspondence regarding Riverbend appraisal motion (.1)

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 4

04/03/14	J. Armington	2.20	572.00	Draft Riverbend appraiser motion and order and generate exhibits, send to P Hunt for review (2.2)
04/03/14	M. Hunt	0.50	185.00	Review and revise motion and order on motion to appoint appraisers for Middleton Idaho home sales (.5)
04/04/14	J. Armington	0.60	156.00	Revise and file motion to appoint riverbend appraisers (.6)
04/04/14	M. Hunt	0.10	37.00	Correspondence with W. Klein and J. Armington regarding filing of motion to appoint appraisers on Riverbend homes (.1)
04/22/14	J. Armington	0.40	104.00	Draft and file notice of publication for Autumn Ridge 3 (.4)
04/22/14	M. Hunt	0.20	74.00	Correspondence with W. Klein and J. Armington regarding Autumn Ridge Lot 2 sale (.1); review notices of publication on Autumn Ridge Lot 3 sale and authorize filing of same (.1)
04/24/14	C. Martinez	1.00	280.00	Prepare for hearing on motion to approve sale of Autumn Ridge Lot Number 3 (1.0)
04/24/14	J. Armington	1.20	312.00	Draft motion to approve sale of Autumn Ridge 2 (1.2)
04/25/14	C. Martinez	1.90	532.00	Prepare for and attend hearing on motion to approve sale of Autumn Ridge Lot number three (1.9)
04/25/14	C. Martinez	0.20	56.00	Draft order granting motion to approve sale of Autumn Ridge lot number three (.2)
04/28/14	J. Armington	0.90	234.00	Call with W Klein regarding Autumn Ridge 2 title report (.1); draft motion and declaration (.8)
04/28/14	M. Hunt	0.10	37.00	Review ecf reports on property sales and correspondence with W. Klein regarding same (.1)
04/30/14	J. Armington	2.20	572.00	Draft Autumn Ridge order, notice of hearing, publication motion and order and

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 5

				compile all documents and send to P Hunt for review (2.2)
04/30/14	M. Hunt	0.60	222.00	Review sale papers on Autumn Ridge Lot 2, including sale and publication motion and comments on same, and publication with W. Klein regarding same (.5); publication with J. Armington regarding order on same and instructions on filing (.1)
04/30/14	E. Stauffer	0.60	111.00	Prepare documents re receiver's motion seeking authorization to sell Autumn Ridge Lot No 3 and forward to Crossman, Wilson, Packer, and Mathison (.6)
05/02/14	J. Armington	1.10	286.00	Revise and file motion to sell Autumn Ridge 2, proposed order, publication motion, declaration and email court proposed orders (1.1)
06/03/14	S. Goldberg	0.30	66.00	Conference with P. Hunt re motion to approve sale of lots 16 and 39 (.3)
06/03/14	M. Hunt	0.30	111.00	Conference with S. Goldberg re Autumn Ridge sale motion (.3)
06/04/14	S. Goldberg	1.30	286.00	Begin drafting motion to sell autumn ridge lots 16 and 39 (1.3)
06/04/14	M. Hunt	0.10	37.00	Review email from W. Klein regarding Autumn Ridge lots 16 & 39 sale, and respond to same (.1)
06/05/14	S. Goldberg	3.90	858.00	Continue drafting motion to approve sale (2); draft declaration in support of motion to approve sale (.6); draft publication motion (1); draft corresponding orders (.3)
06/09/14	S. Goldberg	3.50	770.00	Finish drafting motion to sell, declaration in support, and publication motion for autumn ridge lots 16 & 39 (3.5)
06/09/14	M. Hunt	1.70	629.00	Review and revise motion to sell Autumn Ridge lots 16 and 39 and related declaration and order (1.1); review and revise publication notice papers related to same

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 6

				(.3); email to S. Goldberg regarding revisions and instructions on service of same (.1); read emails from J. Gilson and pick up detailed voicemail regarding foreclosure of Palmer home, review email from W. Klein on same, and respond to J. Gilson (.2)
06/10/14	S. Goldberg	1.30	286.00	Revise and finalize Autumn Ridge lots 16 & 39 documents (1.2); call with W. Klein re same (.1)
06/11/14	S. Goldberg	0.50	110.00	Finalize and supervise filing of motion to sell Autumn Ridge Lots 16 & 39 and related docs (.5)
06/11/14	M. Hunt	0.10	37.00	Correspondence regarding Riverbend home sale issues (.1)
06/16/14	C. Martinez	0.30	84.00	Correspond with title company concerning revisions to Receiver's deed on Autumn Ridge lots (.3)
06/18/14	S. Goldberg	2.30	506.00	Draft motion to sell Riverbend Lot 6 and accompanying docs (2.3)
06/20/14	S. Goldberg	4.80	1,056.00	Draft motion to sell Riverbend Lot 6 and supporting docs (4.8)
06/24/14	S. Goldberg	1.00	220.00	Revise Riverbend Lot 6 sale motion and associated documents (1)
06/24/14	M. Hunt	1.20	444.00	Read and revise Riverbend lot 6 sale papers, including publication motion and sale motion, orders and declarations (.9); conference with S. Goldberg regarding same (.2); further correspondence with S. Goldberg regarding same and email to W. Klein with documents (.1)
06/25/14	S. Goldberg	2.40	528.00	Revise and finalize Riverbend sale motion documents for filing (2.4)
06/25/14	M. Hunt	0.30	111.00	Review email from W. Klein on Riverbend lot 6 sale papers, evaluate same, and respond to same (.2); conference with S.

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY



Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 7

				Goldberg regarding same filing and service of same (.1)
06/26/14	C. Martinez	0.40	112.00	Prepare for hearing on motion for order approving sale of Autumn Ridge Lot 2 (.4)
06/26/14	M. Hunt	0.10	37.00	Correspondence regarding Riverrun Lot 6 sale (.1)
06/27/14	C. Martinez	1.80	504.00	Prepare for and attend hearing on motion to approve sale of Autumn Ridge Lot 2 and investor group's motion to consolidate (1.8)
06/27/14	S. Goldberg	0.70	154.00	Draft and file notice of publication regarding Autumn Ridge (.7)
06/27/14	M. Hunt	0.20	74.00	Correspondence regarding publication notice on Autumn Ridge Lots 16 and 39 sale (.1); review draft notice of publication notice and instructions to S. Goldberg regarding same (.1)
06/30/14	C. Martinez	0.20	56.00	Draft Order authorizing private sale of Autumn Ridge Lot 2 (.2)
07/01/14	S. Goldberg	0.60	132.00	Call with T. Stanley re APS issue and conference with P. Hunt re same (.2); conferences with P. Hunt re Scholle motion (.4)
07/03/14	M. Hunt	0.30	111.00	Conference with W. Klein regarding APS receiver's position with regard to property sale issues (.3)
07/07/14	M. Hunt	0.40	148.00	Conference with M. Gaylord regarding APS position on sale of properties with ABIs and email to W. Klein regarding same (.4)
07/07/14	M. Hunt	1.00	370.00	Prepare for hearing on autumn ridge lot 16 and 36 sale (1.0)
07/08/14	S. Goldberg	0.20	44.00	Review and file proposed order granting sale of Autumn Ridge Lots 16 & 39 (.2)
07/08/14	M. Hunt	0.80	296.00	Attend hearing on sale of Autumn Ridge Lots 16 and 39 (.5) ; revise proposed order

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 8

				based on hearing and email to S. Goldberg regarding same (.3)
07/10/14	S. Goldberg	0.30	66.00	Prepare notice of publication for Riverbend Lot 6 (.3)
07/15/14	M. Hunt	0.40	148.00	Correspondence with Zions bank counsel regarding Riverbend home sale issues (.4)
07/17/14	S. Goldberg	0.20	44.00	Correspondences with P. Hunt and process server re serving W. Scholle (.2)
07/31/14	C. Martinez	0.90	252.00	Prepare for hearing on motion to sell Riverbend Lot 6 (.9)
08/01/14	J. Armington	2.10	546.00	Meet with P Hunt regarding Kanab Cabin sale (.3); review Riverbend motion, order, declaration, and begin drafting Kanab Cabin motions to appoint appraiser and publication motion (1.8)
08/01/14	M. Hunt	0.20	74.00	Correspondence with W. Klein and J. Armington regarding Kanab Cabin sale (.1); conference with J. Armington regarding instructions on same (.1)
08/03/14	J. Armington	1.40	364.00	Draft appraiser motion and publication motion for Kanab cabin (1.4)
08/04/14	C. Martinez	1.80	504.00	Prepare for and attend hearing on Motion Approving Sale of RiverBend Lot 6 and prepare Order approving same (1.8)
08/04/14	J. Armington	1.70	442.00	Drafting Kanab cabin motion and related pleadings (1.7)
08/05/14	J. Armington	5.90	1,534.00	Drafting Kanab cabin appraiser motion, order, publication motion, order, and sale motion, declaration and order
08/06/14	J. Armington	5.70	1,482.00	Finish drafting Kanab cabin appraiser motion, order, sale motion, order, declaration, and publication motion and send to P Hunt for review (5.7)
08/08/14	J. Armington	1.40	364.00	Revise motion to appoint appraisers and publication motion for Kanab cabin (1.4)

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 9

08/08/14	M. Hunt	1.30	481.00	Review and revise appraisal motion and order and send to W. Klein for review (Kanab Cabin) (.3); review and revise publication motion and send to W. Klein for review (Kanab Cabin) (.1); review and revise motion to sell Kanab Cabin and declaration in support and email to W. Klein regarding same (.6) ; further coorispondence with W. Klein re same (.3)
08/11/14	J. Armington	4.10	1,066.00	Revise and prepare Kanab appraiser motion and publication motion for filing (2.1); revise sale motion and declaration and send to W Klein for review (2.0)
08/11/14	M. Hunt	0.20	74.00	Conferences with J. Armington regarding issues on sale of Kane County property (.2)
08/12/14	J. Armington	3.90	1,014.00	Draft and revise Kanab cabin sale motion and declaration and calls to Court regarding hearing date and prepare sale motion and declaration for filing (3.9)
08/12/14	M. Hunt	0.50	185.00	Conferences and correspondence with J. Armington and W. Klein regarding Kanab sale issues (.4); correspondence with J. Andersen regarding FNB interest in Kanab sale, and further correspondence with W. Klein regarding same (.1)
08/13/14	J. Armington	1.20	312.00	Revise and file motion to sell Kanab Cabin and declaration in support of same; calls with Court to obtain hearing date and correspond with P Hunt and W Klein regarding same (1.2)
08/13/14	M. Hunt	0.10	37.00	Correspondence with J. Armington and J. Anderson regarding Kanab sale motion issues (.1)
08/22/14	J. Armington	2.30	598.00	Draft notice of publication and notice of Kanab cabin appraisals and send to P Hunt for review (2.3)

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 10

08/24/14	M. Hunt	0.40	148.00	Review notice of publication on Kanab cabin sale and correspondence on same (.1); correspondence and revise notice of appraisals on correspondence sale motion and motion on same (.3)
08/25/14	J. Armington	0.90	234.00	Coordinate filing of notice of Kanab cabin appraisals and proofs of publication (.9)
08/25/14	M. Hunt	0.10	37.00	Correspondence with L. Dingivan regarding Riverbend lot 6 sale (.1)
08/26/14	C. Martinez	2.20	616.00	Prepare for and argue motion for court to approve sale of Kanab Cabin and prepare proposed order granting motion (2.2)
09/08/14	S. Goldberg	3.30	726.00	Draft motion to amend order approving sale of Riverbend lot 6 and accompanying docs (3.3)
09/08/14	M. Hunt	0.20	74.00	Review and revise motion, declaration and order on amended riverbend lot 6 sale order and email to W. Klein regarding same (.2)
09/17/14	S. Goldberg	1.00	220.00	Revise and prepare motion to amend Riverbend Lot 6 Order docs for filing (.9); correspondences with W. Klein re Palmer records review (.1)
09/17/14	M. Hunt	0.10	37.00	Review and comment on riverbend motion and instructions to S. Goldberg; correspondence with W. Klein regarding same (.1)
09/23/14	S. Goldberg	1.30	286.00	Begin drafting motion to sell Hawthorne Lot (1.3)
09/23/14	M. Hunt	0.30	111.00	Review email from J. Gilson regarding Palmer home foreclosure, email from W. Klein regarding same, and papers to file and respond to J. Gilson regarding same (.3)
09/26/14	S. Goldberg	0.50	110.00	Revise amended order approving sale of Riverbend lot 6 and call with clerk re same

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
Page 11

				(.5)
09/29/14	S. Goldberg	3.40	748.00	Draft motion to sell Hawthorne lot, declaration in support, proposed order, publication sale motion, and second proposed order (3.4)
09/29/14	M. Hunt	0.70	259.00	Review and revise motion, declaration and proposed order on Hawthorne Lot (.5); review and revise motion and proposed order on publication of sale of Hawthorne lot (.2)
09/30/14	S. Goldberg	4.70	1,034.00	Draft motion to appoint appraisers for Almond Heights (1.8); revisions, finalize and filing of Hawthorne Lot docs (2.9)
09/30/14	M. Hunt	0.60	222.00	Conference with S. Goldberg re edits on Hawthorne sale papers and email to W. Klein re draft documents (.1); correspondence with W. Klein re Hawthorne sale motion, revise order per W. Klein's comments, and instructions to S. Goldberg re same (.2); motion and revise motion to appoint appraisers on Almond Heights sales and order on same, and motion with S. Goldberg and W. Klein on same (.3)
10/01/14	S. Goldberg	0.50	135.00	Finalize and file motion to appoint appraisers (.5)
10/13/14	S. Goldberg	1.60	432.00	Draft motion to approve sale of Almond Heights lots (1.6)
10/15/14	S. Goldberg	2.30	621.00	Draft motion to approve sale of Almond Heights lots (2.3)
10/16/14	S. Goldberg	0.60	162.00	Draft and file notice of publication for Hawthorne lot (.6)
10/16/14	M. Hunt	0.10	38.00	Correspondence re Hawthorne Ave sale (.1)
10/17/14	S. Goldberg	3.60	972.00	Draft motion to sell Almond Heights lots (3.6)

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 12

10/21/14	S. Goldberg	4.90	1,323.00	Draft motion to sell Almond Heights lots and associated documents (4.9)
10/22/14	S. Goldberg	2.90	783.00	Draft motion to sell Minnesota property (2.9)
10/28/14	S. Goldberg	1.50	405.00	Draft motion to sell MN property (1.5)
10/28/14	M. Hunt	1.10	418.00	Review and revise motion, declaration and order on sale of Almond Heights Lots and publication papers, and e-mail to S. Goldberg regarding same (1.0) ; correspondence regarding MN property sale (.1)
10/30/14	S. Goldberg	2.10	567.00	Revisions to motion to sell Almond Heights Lots and associated docs (2.1)
10/31/14	C. Martinez	0.80	244.00	Prepare for hearing on motion for approval of sale of Hawthorne property (.8)
10/31/14	C. Martinez	1.60	488.00	Prepare for and attend hearings on motion for approval of sale of Hawthorne Property and D. VanCampen Order to Show Cause (1.3); Draft and submit order approving sale of Hawthorne property (.3)
10/31/14	S. Goldberg	1.00	270.00	Finalize Almond Heights lots sale motions (1.0)
10/31/14	M. Hunt	0.30	114.00	Review Almond Heights sale papers and e-mail to W. Klein regarding same (.3)
11/03/14	S. Goldberg	0.60	162.00	Finalize Almond Heights sale motion docs for filing
11/03/14	M. Hunt	0.10	38.00	Correspondence regarding Almond Heights and MN property sales (.1)
11/05/14	S. Goldberg	3.90	1,053.00	Draft motion to sell and accompanying documents for second Minnesota lot (3.9)
11/06/14	S. Goldberg	1.70	459.00	Draft supplement to Almond Heights motion (1.7)
11/06/14	M. Hunt	1.10	418.00	Review supplemental papers on Almond Heights motion and email to W. Klein

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 13

				regarding same (.2); read and revise mouton, declaration and proposed order on Minnesota sale issues and mouton with S. Goldberg and W. Klein regarding same (.9)
11/07/14	S. Goldberg	2.90	783.00	Prepare auction procedures (.6); revisions to motion to sell Byron West properties and declaration and finalize for filing (1.9); finalize and file supplements to Almond Heights motions (.4)
11/07/14	M. Hunt	0.50	190.00	Correspondence with S. Goldberg and W. Klein regarding Riverrun, Almond Heights and MN Property sale issues, including review of final versions of MN documents for filing and comments on same (.5)
11/07/14	M. Hunt	0.10	38.00	Correspondence with J. Gilson regarding palmer home intervention motion (.1)
11/10/14	S. Goldberg	2.20	594.00	Conference with P. Hunt re Chase intervention motion (.3); call with D. Gilson re same (.1); review pleadings re same (.5); attend hearing re same (1.2); conference with P. Hunt re result of hearing (.1)
11/10/14	M. Hunt	0.30	114.00	Conference with S. Goldberg joined by J. Gilson regarding hearing on Chase Bank intervention motion (.3)
11/11/14	S. Goldberg	0.10	27.00	Review proposed order from D. Gilson (.1)
11/12/14	S. Goldberg	0.10	27.00	Review correspondences between W. Palmer and D. Gilson re motion to intervene (.1)
11/13/14	S. Goldberg	3.50	945.00	Review correspondences from W. Palmer and D. Gilson re Chase intervention (.1); draft documents for motion to sell Minnesota Ando property (3.4)
11/13/14	M. Hunt	0.10	38.00	Correspondence with W. Klein regarding Chase intervention motion issues (.1)
11/16/14	M. Hunt	0.60	228.00	Read and revise draft motion to sell MN

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 14

				industrial park and comments to S. Goldberg on same (.5); further correspondence with S. Goldberg on same (.1)
11/17/14	S. Goldberg	1.90	513.00	Revise, finalize, and file motion to sell Byron West Industrial Park Lot 2 Block 2 and associated documents (1.9)
11/17/14	M. Hunt	0.40	152.00	Conference with S. Goldberg regarding bond issues on MN property and email to W. Klein regarding same (.1); review W. Klein's comments to MN property sale pleadings, further revision of same, and email to S. Goldberg regarding same (.3)
11/21/14	S. Goldberg	0.50	135.00	Draft and file notice of publication for Almond Heights Lots 7, 11, 12, 13, 17 & 26 (.5)
11/21/14	M. Hunt	0.10	38.00	Review publication notices on Almond Heights sale and authorize filing of same and email to W. Klein regarding same (.1)
11/21/14	J. Koontz	1.00	185.00	Create hearing binder for the hearing on motions requesting order approving (1) public sale of property free and clear of interests, (2) method and form of publication notice, and (3) public auction procedures (Byron West Industrial Park Lot 2 Blocks 1 and 2) (1.0)
11/23/14	C. Martinez	0.80	244.00	Prepare for hearing on motions for approval to conduct public sale of Receivership properties in Minnesota (.8)
11/24/14	C. Martinez	2.20	671.00	Prepare for and attend hearing on motion for approval of public sale procedures for sale of lots in Byron, Minnesota (2.2)
11/24/14	S. Goldberg	1.60	432.00	Draft motion to sell Byron West Lot 5 Block 1 (1.6)
12/02/14	C. Martinez	1.50	457.50	Prepare for hearing on motion to approve sale of Almond Heights lots (1.5)

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY



Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 15

12/02/14	A. Trujillo	1.50	277.50	Prepare hearing binders for C. Martinez in preparation for hearing on motion to sell (1.5)
12/03/14	C. Martinez	1.90	579.50	Prepare for and attend hearing on motion seeking court approval for sale of Almond Height lots (1.6); Prepare order granting approval to sell Almond Height lots (.3)
12/03/14	M. Hunt	0.10	38.00	Conference with C Martinez regarding hearing on Almond Heights sale motion (.1)
12/10/14	C. Martinez	0.30	91.50	Phone and email correspondence with title agency seeking to close on Almond Heights lots concerning the procedural steps taken to obtain the Court Order authorizing the sale (.3)
12/11/14	S. Goldberg	0.30	81.00	Conference re injunction hearing (.1); email to J. Gilson re appraisal (.1); review pleadings for hearing (.1)
12/12/14	S. Goldberg	2.50	675.00	Hearing on motion to lift injunction regarding Palmer's home (1); review pleadings regarding same (.6); call with J. Gilson regarding appraisal (.1); review appraisal (.2); begin drafting motion to abandon (.6)
12/12/14	M. Hunt	0.20	76.00	Correspondence with S. Goldberg regarding hearing on motion to intervene regarding Palmer home, review appraisal, and further correspondence regarding same (.2)
12/15/14	S. Goldberg	1.70	459.00	Draft motion to abandon Palmer home (1.7)
12/16/14	S. Goldberg	1.10	297.00	Draft motion to abandon Palmer home, declaration in support and proposed order (1.1)
12/17/14	S. Goldberg	3.40	918.00	Draft motion to abandon Palmer home and associated documents (3.4)
12/18/14	S. Goldberg	0.10	27.00	Call with C. Martinez regarding 12-12 hearing (.1)

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY

Klein & Associates, PLLC  
 Client-Matter No.: 492728-00003  
 Invoice No.: \*\*\*\*\*

May 22, 2015  
 Page 16

12/18/14	M. Hunt	0.40	152.00	Disposition review and revise motion to abandon Palmer house and correspondence with S. Goldberg regarding same (.4)
12/19/14	S. Goldberg	1.30	351.00	Revise, finalize, and file motion to abandon and associated documents (1.3)
12/31/14	S. Goldberg	1.80	486.00	Draft notice of filing of appraisal for Byron West Lot 2 Block 1 and Lot 2 Block 2 (1.8)
12/31/14	M. Hunt	0.70	266.00	Reveiw and revise motion to submit MN property sale approval based on additional appraisals requested by the Court, and email to S. Goldberg re same (.6) ; review revised papers, email to W. Klein re same and instructions to S. Goldberg re same (.1)

**Total Hours                    194.70**

**Total for Legal Fees                    \$52,950.50**

**Total This Invoice                    \$52,950.50**

Service charges are based on rates established by Dorsey & Whitney. A schedule of those rates has been provided and is available upon request. Disbursements and service charges, which either have not been received or processed, will appear on a later statement.

**ALL INVOICES ARE DUE 30 DAYS FROM DATE OF INVOICE UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY AGREED BY DORSEY & WHITNEY**